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Dear Ms Mitchell,

Thank you for your request dated 15/07/2011 regarding guidance for GP’s . 
1. Does your organisation have any current guidance for GPs or other primary care providers regarding requiring or asking for documentation from prospective patients as a) proof of identity or b) proof of address or c) immigration status, on request for registration with the GP practices in your area
2. If answer to 1 is yes, please could you send a copy of the guidance with date of issue and state whether the Local Medical Committee was involved in developing and / or approved the guidance.

3. Has your organisation issued any such guidance in the last 5 years. If such guidance was issued, but subsequently withdrawn, please could you send a copy of the guidance and advise the date when it was withdrawn.

4. Has your local counter fraud officer / professional / specialist undertaken any work relating to the content of the document: "Guidance to GP practices on GP patient registration fraud" published by the NHS Counter Fraud Service in 2010.

5. If answer to 4. is yes, please indicate the following:

  a)  how many practices have been contacted relating to this guidance

b)  how many practices have agreed to implement procedures requiring provision of documentation prior to registration

c)  how many practices have declined to implement such procedures

d)  whether your local counter fraud officer / professional / specialist is still undertaking activity in this area and, if not, when activity ceased and why it ceased

Our response is below:
1. Does your organisation have any current guidance for GPs or other primary care providers regarding requiring or asking for documentation from prospective patients as a) proof of identity or b) proof of address or c) immigration status, on request for registration with the GP practices in your area – I can confirm we do not hold the information as specified in your request.
2. If answer to 1 is yes, please could you send a copy of the guidance with date of issue and state whether the Local Medical Committee was involved in developing and / or approved the guidance.

3. Has your organisation issued any such guidance in the last 5 years. If such guidance was issued, but subsequently withdrawn, please could you send a copy of the guidance and advise the date when it was withdrawn – I can confirm we do not hold the information as specified in your request.
4. Has your local counter fraud officer / professional / specialist undertaken any work relating to the content of the document: "Guidance to GP practices on GP patient registration fraud" published by the NHS Counter Fraud Service in 2010. - Yes

5. If answer to 4. is yes, please indicate the following:  
a)  how many practices have been contacted relating to this guidance - 74

                
b)  how many practices have agreed to implement procedures requiring provision of documentation prior to registration – We do not hold the information as specified in your request

c)  how many practices have declined to implement such procedures – I can confirm we do not hold the information as specified in your request

d)  whether your local counter fraud officer / professional / specialist is still undertaking activity in this area and, if not, when activity ceased and why it ceased - Yes

                
If you are not satisfied with the information you have been provided with, make a complaint or wish to request an internal review you should write to Pauline Brown, Information Governance Manager at the above address. This should be done within a reasonable period of time from receiving this response.

If you are not satisfied with our review under the Freedom of Information Act, you may apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. Generally, the Information Commissioner’s Office cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted our complaints procedure. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:
The Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF

If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact me quoting the above reference number.

Yours sincerely,

Ruth Quinn
Information Governance
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